
EASTERN REGIONAL FFA LIVESTOCK CAREER DEVELOPMENT EVENT 

OBJECTIVES 

1. To understand and to interpret the value of performance data based on industry standards. 

2. To measure the students’ knowledge in the following categories: 

3. To make accurate observations of livestock 

4. To determine the desirable traits in animals 

5. To make logical decisions based on these observations 

6. To discuss and defend their decisions for their placings 

7. To instill an appreciation for desirable selection, management, and marketing techniques 

8. To develop the ability to select and market livestock that will satisfy consumer demands and 
provide increased economic returns to producers. Provide positive economic returns to producers 
as well as meet the needs of industry. 

9. To become proficient in communicating in the terminology of the industry and the consumer. 

10. To identify the criteria used in grading livestock. Scenarios will be used in the selection process. 

11. To provide an opportunity for participants to become acquainted with professionals in the 
industry. 

12. To provide an opportunity for participants to make new friends through friendly competition. 

 

EVENT RULES 

1. Teams will be comprised of four members. All four scores will be used to determine the total 
team score. 

2. Official dress is required for this event; however, members may wear dark jeans and hard 
shoes/boots, and females may wear dark jeans/slacks and hard shoes/boots. NO “CASUAL” FFA 
DRESS! 

3. Registration will be at 7:00 a.m., Saturday September, 14 in the Coliseum. The event schedule 
will be as follows: 

7 :00 a.m. Team Registration     Coliseum 

7:30 a.m. Placing Classes/Team Activity  Coliseum 

Oral Reasons        E Barn 

Students are released to their advisors at the conclusion of oral reasons. 

4. Contestants will be provided with a box lunch during the event, courtesy of the Eastern States 
Exposition. 



5. Contestants must bring pencils and clean clipboards for this event. Scantrons will be used for all 
placing classes & written portions of the event. Paper for reasons note-taking will be provided. 

6. Contestants will rotate through each species until all classes are complete. There is to be no 
talking during the event – any contestant that violates this rule will receive zero points for that class! 

7. No cell phones – they must be handed in to each chapter advisor prior to the start of the contest. 
If a contestants’ cell phone goes off during the event, that individual will be disqualified. 

EVENT FORMAT 

A. Individual Activities: 

1. Placing Classes – Classes will be determined by the available animals being exhibited at The Big 
E, with a minimum of three sheep, three swine, and three beef cattle classes. Each class is worth 
50 points & contestants will be given 15 minutes for each class. (450 points possible) 

2. Keep/cull Class – Classes will be presented with a production scenario to evaluate the 8 animals 
in the class. Each animal will be assigned a point value, with the correct answer totaling 50 points. 
(50 points) 

3. Oral Reasons – Each contestant will give three sets of oral reasons, to be determined on the day 
of the CDE by the CDE committee & officials. Each set of reasons is worth 50 points. (150 points) 

B. Team Activity: 

1. Placing Questions – All 4 team members will work together to answer 10 questions based on a 
live animal class; a scenario and/or performance data may be provided as needed. Teams will have 
15 minutes to complete this section. (100 points) 

TIEBREAKERS 

If ties occur, the following events will be used to determine award recipients: 

1. We will follow the National FFA Livestock Evaluation CDE tiebreakers, which are as follows (for 
teams as well as 

individual ties): 

a. Total Reasons Score 

b. Total Placing Score 

c. Keep/Cull Score 

Awards 

Awards will be presented at the awards banquet. Awards are presented to teams as well as 
individuals based upon their rankings. The awards are sponsored by The Big E. 


